
Parcel Owner(s) Location Starting Bid Results Notes
Blythe Township
2-7-34. Murray, William Sr. Estate 136 Sunset Ln. 6,830.00$     No bid
2-7-46. Donald, Thomas J. 76 Tucker Hill Rd. 1,427.00$     No bid
Butler Township
4-19-40. Meier, Alan R. & Snyder, Sharon 3096 Main St. 17,734.00$  No bid
4-23-11. Kimmel, Lillian & Palmer c/o Coyle, Ruby 65 Nater St. 6,362.00$     Sold to bidder #11 for $15,000.00
East Union Township
9-13-82. Vilcko, John c/o Sartori, Diane aka Garrett, Diane 24 Pine St. 1,940.00$     bidder forfeit, off to repository
Norwegian Township
20-10-73 Schwartz, Fred W. Parkmeadow Dr. 1,768.00$     Sold to bidder #44 for $1,768.00
Porter Township
22-12-32 Morgan, Rodney E. & Keith R. 43 Main St. 4,597.00$     Sold to bidder #21 $17,500.00
Reilly Township
24-2-38 Lavelle, Mary; Gronauer, Lois; & Santa Maria, Rosalie N. State Rd. 1,088.00$     No bid
24-10-119 Haluska, Lance R. St. Marys Ave. 862.00$        Sold to bidder #63 for $862.00
24-10-120 Haluska, Lance R. St. Marys Ave. Ext. 1,088.00$     Sold to bidder #34 for $1,500.00
Wayne Township
34-22-287 Spring Meadow Homes, Inc. 287 Hogan Dr. 6,873.00$     No bid
34-23-383 Staniszewski, Jill 383 Tomahawk Dr. 1,412.00$     Sold to bidder #57 for $2,500.00
34-26-1119 Spring Meadow Homes, Inc. 1119 Wynonah Dr. 7,268.00$     Sold to bidder #41 for $7,268.00
34-28-2522 Staniszewski, Jill 2522 Papoose Dr. 1,500.00$     Sold to bidder #57 for $1,500.00
West Brunswick Township
35-10-12 Stine, Darien Rodger 417 Lake Front Dr. 1,089.00$     Sold to bidder #12 for $16,500.00
West Mahanoy Township
36-4-85 Margerum, Denise 15 High Rd. 1,872.00$     Sold to #19 for $3,500.00
36-4-87 Carduff, Michael & Mary 491 Mount Olive Blvd. 1,727.00$     No bid
36-4-325.1 Drumheller, Roy c/o Drumheller, Regina E. 267 Mount Olive Blvd. 1,355.00$     Sold to bidder #19 for $1,355.00
West Penn Township
37-20-77.72 Williams, Kenneth & Beverly 49 Revelation Dr. 1,718.00$     Sold to bidder #56 for $7,500.00
Ashland Borough
38-2-73 Chester, Kristin L. 1020 Arch St. 3,477.00$     No bid
38-2-74 Heiser, Mark 1031 Market St. 1,560.00$     Sold to bidder #28 for $1,560.00
38-2-222 Deeter, Ronald C. Market St. 1,366.00$     No bid
38-2-228.1 Geary, Stephen J. Chestnut St. 1,760.00$     Sold to bidder #42 for $1,760.00
38-3-79 Drake, Robert Chestnut St. 1,975.00$     No bid
38-3-369.1 Kenneff, John James Thomas Middle St. 1,186.00$     No bid
38-4-44 Boulier, Richard J. 512 Oakland St. 6,304.00$     Sold to bidder #9 $15,500.00
Coaldale Borough
40-3-130 Quality Heating & Renovations, Inc. 146 Fisher Ave. 1,914.00$     Sold to bidder #6 for $2.500.00
Gilberton Borough
44-4-120 Miller, Pauline A. Bridge St. 2,106.00$     Sold to bidder #16 for $2,500.00
44-4-79.1 Miller, Pauline A. 18 Bridge St. 2,106.00$     Sold to bidder #56 for $21,000.00
44-5-22 Pautienus, Edward R. (deceased) c/o Carl, Joan Main St. 1,687.00$     No bid
44-5-66 Sarra, James C. c/o Hopkins, Holly 1108 N. Main St. 1,354.00$     No bid
44-5-66.1 Sarra, James C. c/o Hopkins, Holly 108 N. Main St. 1,460.00$     Sold to bidder #75 for $3,000.00
44-5-68.1 Galeano, Jorge Edwardo Martinez 1116-1118 Main St. 3,402.00$     Sold to bidder #74 for $4,000.00
44-5-71 McCabe, Mary Ann 1120 Main St. 1,163.00$     Sold to bidder #56 for $3,000.00



44-6-191 Stank, James Jr. 126 Main St. 1,185.00$     No bid
44-7-19 Hoffman, Mary T. 26 Long Row Rd. 1,715.00$     No bid
44-7-40 Pytko, Diane c/o Pytko, John 174 Long Row Rd. 1,369.00$     bidder forfeit, off to repository
44-7-52 McClain, David P. c/o McClain, Aaron 11 Draper St. 1,464.00$     Sold to bidder #24 for $4,500.00
44-7-53 McClain, David P. c/o McClain, Aaron 9 Draper St. 1,443.00$     Sold to #19 for $2,000.00
44-7-80 Martinson, George 2 Long Row Rd. 2,776.00$     No bid
Girardville Borough
45-6-77 Benitez, Jose 217 Second St. 9,714.00$     Sold to bidder #61 for $18,500.00
45-8-109.2 Connors, Shawn & Michelle W. Railroad St. 1,524.00$     No bid
45-9-108 Wegner, Brett 153 Preston Ave. 3,987.00$     Sold to bidder #66 for $5,500.00
45-9-66 Gomosky, Vincent c/o Gomosky, Jessica Preston Ave. 1,586.00$     Sold to bidder #3 for $2,500.00
45-9-75 Gomosky, David & Julia Preston Ave. 1,616.00$     Sold to bidder #3 for $3,500.00
45-9-77 Gomosky, Vincent c/o Gomosky, Jessica William St. 1,341.00$     No bid
Mahanoy City Borough
48-3-16 Yakimovich, Paul W. Birch St. 2,465.00$     Sold to bidder #18 for $2,465.00
48-3-22 Nightingale, Robert M. & Tony J. 122 W. Birch St. 1,707.00$     bidder forfeit, off to repository Demolition required
48-4-72 Mizic, Anthony J. 225 E. Center St. 1,072.00$     Sold to bidder #76 for $3,000.00
48-5-11 Bruner Realty, LLC 513 E. Center St. 4,613.00$     Sold to bidder #56 for $11,000.00
48-8-281 Ernst, Lynda Ann & Uditis Al D. 253 W. Mahanoy Ave. 19,418.00$  - Trump bid placed by Schuylkill County Land Bank
48-8-604 Kufrovich, Francis & Helen 104 S. Grant St. 3,700.00$     No bid
48-9-126 Gaval, John H. 26 W. South St. 20,907.00$  No bid Demolition required
48-9-219.1 Brill, Violet W. Maple St. 1,487.00$     Sold to bidder #76 for $1,487.00
Shenandoah Borough
64-4-424 Przybylik, Carmella C. 124 N. Catherine St. 2,701.00$     bidder forfeit, off to repository
64-4-572 Kacelowicz, Edward P. 233 W. Mt. Vernon St. 2,145.00$     Sold to bidder #76 for $2,145.00
64-5-445 Benjamin, Michael Jr. 30 E. Lloyd St. 1,892.00$     Sold to bidder #32 for $1,892.00
64-5-555 Aguilar, Victor M. & Leslie Y. 34 E. Centre St. 1,695.00$     Sold to bidder #62 for $53,000.00
64-7-583 Miller, Gloria & Dennis (deceased) 318 W. Chester St. 1,332.00$     Sold to bidder #9 for $31,000.00
64-8-352.10 Bueno, Victor & Rivera, Karla M. S. White St. 1,088.00$     No bid
Tamaqua Borough
65-8-205 Clouser, David Earl 401 Willing St. 4,855.00$     - Trump bid placed by Schuylkill County Land Bank
65-8-223 Clouser, David Earl 423 Willing St. 4,833.00$     - Trump bid placed by Schuylkill County Land Bank
65-11-144 Frye, Cindy M. 200 Pitt St. 5,685.00$     - Trump bid placed by Schuylkill County Land Bank
Pottsville City
68-19-222 Reed, Jamie M. N. Seventh St. 1,286.00$     Sold to bidder #86 for $1,286.00
68-39-50 Doyle, John & Mgt B Elk Ave. 1,578.00$     Sold to bidder #86 for $3,000.00


