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Sale number
25-0048
25-0093
25-0131
25-0139
25-0158
25-0163
25-0168
25-0212
25-0213
25-0214
25-0218
25-0219
25-0220
25-0222
25-0224
25-0227
25-0229
25-0230
25-0232
25-0234
25-0239
25-0240
25-0241
25-0242
25-0243
25-0244
25-0247
25-0249
25-0250
25-0326
25-0346
25-0347
25-0351
25-0354
25-0356
25-0357
25-0360
25-0361
25-0379
25-0382
25-0383
25-0385
25-0409
25-0420
25-0426
25-0427
25-0428
25-0429
25-0431
25-0432
25-0433
25-0434
25-0435
25-0436
25-0437
25-0441
25-0445
25-0448
25-0449
25-0450
25-0451
25-0452
25-0453
25-0454
25-0463
25-0464
25-0465
25-0478
25-0479
25-0481
25-0482
25-0485
25-0512
25-0517
25-0546
25-0548
25-0555
25-0559
25-0560
25-0561
25-0574
25-0582
25-0586
25-0587
25-0590
25-0604

&

Date of Sale
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th

Municipality

BRANCH TOWNSHIP
CASS TOWNSHIP

CASS TOWNSHIP

CASS TOWNSHIP
DELANO TOWNSHIP
EAST BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
EAST BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
EAST UNION TOWNSHIP
HUBLEY TOWNSHIP
KLINE TOWNSHIP

KLINE TOWNSHIP

KLINE TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
NORTH MANHEIM TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORTH UNION TOWNSHIP
NORWEGIAN TOWNSHIP
NORWEGIAN TOWNSHIP
NORWEGIAN TOWNSHIP
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
PORTER TOWNSHIP
PORTER TOWNSHIP
RYAN TOWNSHIP

RYAN TOWNSHIP

RYAN TOWNSHIP

RYAN TOWNSHIP

RYAN TOWNSHIP

RYAN TOWNSHIP
SCHUYLKILL TOWNSHIP
SCHUYLKILL TOWNSHIP
SOUTH MANHEIM TOWNSHIP
SOUTH MANHEIM TOWNSHIP
SOUTH MANHEIM TOWNSHIP
UNION TOWNSHIP

Parcel

03-13-0137.001
05-05-0020.001
05-16-0021.001
05-17-0036.000
06-09-0095.000
07-02-0030.000
07-08-0062.001
09-16-0166.000
09-16-0222.000
09-16-0401.000
09-16-0443.000
09-16-0454.000
09-17-0223.000
09-17-0266.000
09-18-0004.000
09-20-0088.000
09-20-0156.000
09-20-0203.000
09-20-0221.000
09-20-0287.000
09-20-0431.000
09-22-0008.000
09-22-0056.000
09-22-0058.000
09-22-0093.000
09-23-0069.000
09-23-0123.000
09-23-0147.000
09-23-0188.000
14-03-0022.001
15-12-0195.000
15-12-0196.000
15-13-0025.001
16-05-0055.000
16-08-0008.007
16-08-0008.009
16-08-0040.023
16-08-0040.025
16-17-0015.008
16-18-0012.000
16-18-0113.000
16-18-0122.000
18-16-0081.000
19-03-0011.000
19-12-0085.000
19-12-0103.000
19-13-0266.000
19-13-0276.000
19-13-0555.000
19-13-0576.000
19-15-0015.000
19-15-0086.000
19-17-0091.000
19-18-0033.000
19-18-0039.000
19-18-0054.000
19-20-0132.000
19-21-0198.000
19-21-0220.000
19-23-0267.000
19-24-0003.000
19-24-0008.000
19-26-0055.000
19-26-0072.000
20-05-0009.000
20-05-0010.000
20-05-0011.000
21-04-0005.025
21-04-0005.026
21-05-0062.003
21-05-0064.001
21-08-0080.000
22-14-0052.000
22-16-0030.001
26-03-0056.000
26-04-0064.001
26-12-0011.005
26-13-0108.000
26-13-0109.000
26-13-0110.001
27-08-0064.000
27-09-0150.000
28-17-0772.000
28-17-0774.000
28-21-1424.000
30-05-0055.055

Owner

KILLIAN, DARYL P

OBRIEN, JAMES
SZANKOVICS,TIFFANY & MATTHEW B
AGRAMONTE,ERICK & ANGULO,NICOL
CORINCHOCK, RUTH (DECD)
SCHAEFFER, FRANCIS
GONZALEZ, MYRIAM G

GARCIA, ANTONIO M

FOR P MULVANY,DECLAN DUGGA & M
AMBE, DOMINADOR PLAZA
BACAREZA, VIOLETA LINDA G
EPISCOPE DIVINA & DANILO R
VAHDATSHOAR, FRAIDOON
CIOTTI, MARY ELLEN

GARCIA, ANTONIO M

GARCIA, ANTONIO M
YAMPAGLIA,MARK & SHIRLEY
GERMOSEN, WILSON

PURNELL, HARRIS E
MADRIGAL,CHARMAINE ETAL
HENDERSON,CHARLES E ETAL
KARANJA KEVIN KAMIRI ETAL
LIANGCO,PAUL & FRANCISCA
GARCIA, ANTONIO M

SHIN,NOE HA & YOON,ICK
AKINMUTIMI, ABIOLA ABOSEDE
GERMOSEN, WILSON

MWAURA NDURU,ISAIAH D ETAL
YONZON,SILVESTRE A & ALMA T
SCHLEGEL,LARRY L & THERESA
JANCEWICZ, BENEDICT T
JANCEWICZ, BENEDICT T
FRANCIS, JAY WILLIAM
SCHROOP, JAMES A

WE AGAPE YOU, INC

WE AGAPE YOU, INC

GARCIA, ANTONIO M

GERMOSEN, WILSON

WOLFE, WILLIAM

WILLIAMS, HARRY
GOSHANEY,EDWARD G & ANNE R
PENA, SERGIO

FISHER, HARRISON A

ROMAN, CRISTIAN
GARCIA-OVALLES, ANTONIO M
MOYER,SHEILA KAY

GERMOSEN, WILSON

MARKS, MATT

BOVE,ROBERT & TAMARA
WERNER,JAMES | & ELFRIEDE TR
PENA, BLANCA

ORAM,NICKOLA J ETAL

CHACON PEREZ,J. & MATEO CHACON
AGUSTIN,EDMUNDO D ETAL
VELEZ, ENRIQUE

GARCIA, ANTONIO M
KRAFFT,STEPHEN C & LANY B
SANTIAGO,SONIA & MALACK,ALE
FELICIANO, ROBERTO LUNA
PILOTIN,BONIFACIO A & MEDINA
GANON,JESSIE & TIU, CHARMAINE
BROWNE,FREDERICK A & PAULITA A
FRONDOZA,ROBERTO & NOEME
BAUTISTA, MARIA GLENDA G
CRAMER ,MARK R ESTATE
CRAMER ,MARK R ESTATE
CRAMER ,MARK R ESTATE

BUJAK, JENNIFER M
MICKLO,STEPHEN M & TAMMY ANN
HILL, CAROL (DECD)

REITER, MICHAEL J

DONTON, KEVIN C

CASTILLO MORLA, SANTO E
GRAMM, EUGENE W
BLUME,DAVID L & MARY ELLEN
MERENDA, DAVID A & MARY E
PLEBAN,FRANK & GRUTZA,SHANNON
PETRITSCH, FREDERICK J
PETRITSCH, FREDERICK J
PETRITSCH, FREDERICK J
VALENTINE, MICHELLE LEIGH
DROGUS, HOWARD T

GARCIA, ANTONIO

GARCIA, ANTONIO

MOHAN, PANTA

FOOSE, ELAINE

Property Description
0 WILLING STREET
49 CHERRY VALLEY ROAD
0 WHITE LANE

907 SUNBURY RD

63 W HAZLE ST

261 COLD RUN ROAD
4 PENNY LANE
POCAHONTAS DR
WARRIOR PATH
SUMMIT CIR

SUMMIT CIR

SUMMIT VIEW DR

0 W PLAYERS WAY
POINT WOODS RD

4 WALDEN CT
BUTTE RD

0 MAVERICK WY

NE SIDE ADOBE WAY
ADOBE WAY
CORRAL RD
CACTUS CT

0 PEACE PIPE DR
LENAPE LN

0 MOHICAN CT

N SIDE OF CREEKSIDE DR
MID SUMMIT DR

MID SUMMIT DR

CREEK SIDE DR

168 MAHANTONGO STREE
0 BRIDGE STREET

0 BRIDGE STREET

27 DORAN ST

21 GLENDON ROAD

14 SUFFOLK RD

11 SUFFOLK

11 WILLOW STREET

19 WILLOW ST

0 MAIN STREET

65 ROOSEVELT DRIVE

89 LOWER STREET

121 LOWER STREET

23 N LAKE DRIVE

WOOD RD

258 MAHANOY STREET
253 MAHANOY STREET

0 S CHAMOIX LANE

0 W CAMELBACK LN

0 S HAYSTACK DR

0 N CHAMOIX LANE

0 N ARAPAHOE LANE

0 S LAMESADR

0 ARAPAHOE LN

0 TUSCARORA DRIVE WES
0 SHENANGO DRIVE

0 SHENANGO DRIVE

132 W KENOZA DRIVE

0 NE SIDE BLACKFOOT DR
0 N SIDE TUSCARORA DR,
TEME DR

SAYRE DR

SAYRE LN

PRIMROSE LN

PRIMROSE BLVD
SELTZER POTTSVILLE RD
SELTZER POTTSVILLE RD
SELTZER POTTSVILLE RD
9 FIDLER CT

8 FIDLER CT

23 SPRUCE DRIVE

176 SPITTLER RD
DARKWOODS RD

1201 E GRAND AVENUE
308 N KEYSTONE ST
BACK RD

57 SHADY LANE

31 WILL AVE

0 CHESTNUT STREET
FIFTH AVE

FIFTH AVE

59 LOCUST AVENUE

345 VALLEY STREET

772 CHEYENNE DRIVE
774 CHEYENNE DRIVE
1424 STAG DRIVE

2620 MELANIE MANOR

Upset Price

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
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$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
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$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

1,439.47
5,613.58
1,001.76
7,153.72
3,707.95
4,042.80

876.74
1,524.70
1,595.11
1,595.10
1,595.10
1,472.45
3,041.85
3,213.29
1,530.43
1,530.43
2,107.48
1,508.25
1,595.10
1,496.85
1,604.34
1,595.10
1,605.92
1,604.34
1,423.15
1,499.69
1,499.69
1,570.10
1,425.78
1,677.12
1,325.11
1,272.53
1,279.61
1,864.42
1,478.84
1,145.46
2,901.06
3,374.02
1,246.46
6,153.27
2,652.63

851.97

11,440.47
2,211.99
4,544.14
4,381.11
1,250.57
1,305.84
1,305.84
1,330.84
1,517.18
1,542.18
1,612.24
1,621.68
1,621.68
1,542.18
1,596.68
1,593.55
1,616.95
1,515.71
2,230.69

950.65
2,230.69
2,255.69

726.37
1,371.68
1,077.78
1,548.70

898.51

15,129.90

10,302.69

653.11
4,345.26
2,950.63
3,975.30

33,822.04

84,759.29
1,828.18

812.58

922.66
8,469.17

Bidder's Name

Kaska Properties, LLC
Miguel Pantoja

Garth Lakitsky

Rosiris Cruz Ortiz
Kopp Market, Inc
Judicial Sale April
Judicial Sale April
Judicial Sale April
Vincent Pantarelii

Judicial Sale April
Lawrence Roman

Judicial Sale April

Kopp Market, Inc

Breadbasket Properties, LLC

Nick Stanley Ramos Valdez

Vera Malshyti

Juan W. Baez
Daniel P. Drouare
Jose R. Larosa, Jr.
Patrick Martin, LLC
David Tchorzewski
Kopp Market, Inc

Lia Fisher
Tomgato, LLC

Judicial Sale April

need bidder sheet
Patrick Martin, LLC
Victor M Santiago

Shawn Schnoke
Judicial Sale April

David Tchorzewski
Jordan Mroczka

MDA Building Construction

| Reults

[No bid

|Sold to bidder #106 for $13,500.00
\Property removed - paid in full

[No bid

|Sold to bidder #82 for $30,000.00
|Sold to bidder #114 for the minimum
|Sold to bidder #319 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #387 for the minimum
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
[No bid

|Sold to bidder #469 for the minimum
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Sold to bidder #356 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
No bid

Sold to bidder #387 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to #6 for the minimum

No bid

Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #238 for $11,500.00
No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #311 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #368 for $31,000.00
Sold to bidder #125 for $3,500.00
Sold to bidder #67 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #202 for the minimum
Property removed - paid in full

No bid

Sold to bidder #354 for $6,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #387 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #294 for $2,500.00
|Sold to bidder #467 for the minimum
[No bid

[No bid

Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #45 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #202 for $16,500.00
Sold to bidder #45 for $1,500.00

No bid

No bid

Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #419 for $178,000.00
No bid

Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Sold to bidder #354 for $12,500.00
Sold to bidder #243 for $19,500.00
Property removed - paid in full
Property removed - bankruptcy filed
Property removed - paid in full
Property removed - paid in full
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #257 for the minimum

9,647.51 ‘ Romeo Venture Capital, LLC
1,875.36 Michael & Jennifer Harvey
1,875.36 ‘ Romeo Venture Capital, LLC
1,805.16 Michael & Jennifer Harvey
1,462.25 |

|Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #278 for the minimum
| Sold to bidder #245 for $6,500.00
Sold to bidder #278 for the minimum
[No bid
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25-0618
25-0621
25-0656
25-0659
25-0667
25-0675
25-0679
25-0682
25-0693
25-0710
25-0714
25-0720
25-0786
25-0788
25-0789
25-0790
25-0791
25-0819
25-0835
25-0836
25-0844
25-0848
25-0858
25-0865
25-0878
25-0880
25-0885
25-0904
25-0905
25-0906
25-0907
25-0913
25-0930
25-0940
25-0946
25-0952
25-0957
25-0976
25-0987
25-1000
25-1005
25-1023
25-1033
25-1049
25-1054
25-1059
25-1066
25-1069
25-1070
25-1071
25-1072
25-1077
25-1079
25-1094
25-1096
25-1109
25-1111
25-1113
25-1122
25-1124
25-1137
25-1150
25-1177
25-1178
25-1185
25-1197
25-1218
25-1219
25-1228
25-1229
25-1250
25-1262
25-1267
25-1268
25-1272
25-1290
25-1305
25-1306
25-1307
25-1311
25-1316
25-1320
25-1322
25-1335
25-1341
25-1343
25-1346

Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th

UPPER MAHANTONGO TOWNSI
UPPER MAHANTONGO TOWNSI

WAYNE TOWNSHIP
WAYNE TOWNSHIP

WEST BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP

WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
WEST MAHANOY TOWNSHIP
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
ASHLAND BOROUGH
AUBURN BOROUGH
AUBURN BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
COALDALE BOROUGH
CRESSONA BOROUGH
CRESSONA BOROUGH
CRESSONA BOROUGH
FRACKVILLE BOROUGH
FRACKVILLE BOROUGH
FRACKVILLE BOROUGH
FRACKVILLE BOROUGH
GILBERTON BOROUGH
GILBERTON BOROUGH
GILBERTON BOROUGH
GILBERTON BOROUGH
GILBERTON BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
GIRARDVILLE BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH

31-04-0061.000
31-07-0074.000
34-19-0014.008
34-23-0386.000
35-08-0093.002
36-02-0100.000
36-02-0132.001
36-04-0042.000
36-04-0451.000
36-08-0160.000
36-09-0050.000
36-11-0045.000
38-02-0191.000
38-02-0229.000
38-02-0230.000
38-02-0231.001
38-02-0241.000
38-03-0329.000
38-04-0009.000
38-04-0012.000
38-06-0050.000
38-06-0149.000
38-06-0255.000
38-06-0336.000
39-03-0054.000
39-03-0074.002
40-01-0011.000
40-02-0400.000
40-02-0403.000
40-02-0404.000
40-02-0406.000
40-02-0615.000
40-05-0031.000
40-06-0060.000
41-04-0146.000
41-05-0052.000
41-07-0082.000
43-03-0075.000
43-03-0420.000
43-04-0134.000
43-04-0378.000
44-03-0049.000
44-04-0048.000
44-06-0077.000
44-06-0168.004
44-07-0057.000
45-03-0010.000
45-03-0075.012
45-03-0077.000
45-03-0078.000
45-03-0079.000
45-05-0081.000
45-05-0097.000
45-06-0200.000
45-06-0267.000
45-09-0022.000
45-09-0101.000
45-09-0115.000
48-01-0020.000
48-03-0003.000
48-03-0097.000
48-04-0220.000
48-05-0050.000
48-05-0063.000
48-05-0106.000
48-05-0335.000
48-05-0478.001
48-05-0488.000
48-05-0572.000
48-05-0589.000
48-06-0170.000
48-06-0298.000
48-07-0030.000
48-07-0032.001
48-07-0060.000
48-08-0128.000
48-08-0234.000
48-08-0247.000
48-08-0248.000
48-08-0274.000
48-08-0370.000
48-08-0398.000
48-08-0415.001
48-08-0592.000
48-08-0646.000
48-08-0673.001
48-08-0697.008

SHERRY,RUTH ANN 0 HEIM ROAD $ 1,300.88 | JMAC Realty, LLC Sold to bidder #139 for $61,000.00 - Bidder will be refunded-taxes pd
WEIST CHARLES & MARY (DECD) 0 VISTA ROAD $ 1,325.82 | Michael G. Deibert Sold to bidder #24 for $19,000.00
WOLFE, JEFFERY (DECD) BLUE MOUNTAIN HTS $ 3,864.25 | Kol Malshyti Sold to bidder #138 for the minimum
STOLTZFUS, A & MARTIN, W 386 TOMAHAWK DR $ 3,109.89 | JMAC Realty, LLC Sold to bidder #139 for $5,500.00
REEDY,BRUCE L & JOYCE C (DECD) FORT LEBANON RD $ 2,185.96 | JMAC Realty, LLC Sold to bidder #139 for the minimum
DAUBERT, ALEX 1100 W COAL ST $ 6,140.88 | Wilfredo Gonzalez Sold to bidder #229 for $7,000.00
PRONIO,ALBERT F & MARYANN G 1159 W CENTER STREET | § 2,827.41 | David Tchorzewski Sold to bidder #354 for $7,500.00
DANOUSKY, PAUL 592 MOUNT OLIVEBLVD | § 2,252.01 | Judicial Sale April Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
MOLINA, ELOY 207 MOUNT OLIVEBLVD | § 1,316.42 | Hector Homero Yunga Sold to bidder #324 for $4,500.00
MITCHELL, SANDRA M 160 SCHUYLKILL AVENUE | $  16,918.70 | Marek Tchorzewski Sold to bidder #370 for $27,000.00
CHANCE, CHRISTINE L 189 VIRGINIA AVE $  19,431.83 | Kol Malshyti Sold to bidder #138 for the minimum
COOPER, ANNESS 3 N SPENCER STREET $ 5,678.10 | OWR, LLC Sold to bidder #78 for $11,000.00
VAZQUEZ, FREDDY 1400 -1402 MARKET STREE $ 4,819.82 | Juan Marino Sold to bidder #49 for the minimum
GOLAZESKI, LEE 1008 MARKET ST $ 1,434.47 No bid

GOLAZESKI, LEE 1006 MARKET ST $ 1,090.65 No bid

GOLAZESKI, LEE 1001 CHESTNUT STREET | $§  12,017.12 No bid

DAMROSE,JOHN & MISCHELLE 1101 CENTRE ST $ 16,122.34 Property removed - paid in full
MELO, BRIAN ANTHONY 1017 WALNUT STREET $ 5,228.06 | YHVH Home, LLC Sold to bidder #446 for the mininmum
DIMAREN, BELKIS M 70 OAKLAND AVENUE $ 9,501.02 | Jaun F. Marino Sold to bidder #49 for the minimum
GERMOSEN, WILSON 84 OAKLAND AVENUE $ 751.32 | YHVH Home, LLC Sold to bidder #446 for $2,000.00
KITSON,TIMOTHY A & ALEXIS 1822 CENTRE ST $ 5,884.08 No bid

BALTHASER,EDWARD E & MARIANNE 0 WALNUT STREET $ 1,236.09 No bid

TOLENTINO, RAUL 1618 WALNUT STREET $ 11,195.02 | YHVH Home, LLC Sold to bidder #446 for the mininmum
GOMEZ, JOSE A 1408 SPRUCE STREET $ 4,779.90 | YHVH Home, LLC Sold to bidder #446 for $7,000.00
REEDY,BRUCE L ETAL 514 BEAR CREEK ST $ 4,900.93 | Marco L. Bonay Sold to bidder #450 for the minimum
ROGERS,JR VERNON C & DIANE L 768 BEAR CREEK ST $ 9,672.77 | 200825 Portfolio Trust Sold to bidder #215 for $68,000.00
GIAMBONA, ANGELO $ 10,975.14 No bid

KIDDA, BERNARD 0 W RUDDLE STREET $ 2,320.74 No bid

KIDDA, BERNARD ETAL 242 W RUDDLE STREET $ 5,968.09 | Marie Roseline Alexandre Sold to bidder #296 for $26,000.00
KIDDA, ANNA 0 W RUDDLE STREET $ 1,553.98 No bid

KIDDA, BERNARD 0 W RUDDLE STREET $ 3,189.82 No bid

POLANSKY,MICHAEL & MARY A 50 E HOWARD AVENUE $ 35670.39 No bid

WAGNER, FRIEDA B 103 W MINER STREET $ 17,213.31 | Leventry Real Estate LLC Sold to bidder #232 for $22,000.00
GARAVUSO, MICHELLE 270 SIXTH STREET $ 23,617.03 No bid

PETRECZ, TABITHA 38 RIVER STREET $ 10,488.13 | Marek Tchorzewski Sold to bidder #370 for $29,000.00
JARAMILLO, MARCO 88 POTTSVILLE STREET | § 8,322.16 | Rieckehoff & Benjamin LLC Sold to bidder #175 for $15,500.00
SCHWARTZ,LEO & NANCY K 150 CHESTNUT STREET $ 9,190.02 Property removed - paid in full
DECURNOU, PATRICIA A 139 N CENTER STREET $ 8,874.92 | Miguel Angel Pantoja Sold to bidder #82 for $32,000.00
KARSKI, MAREK 524 MORRIS STREET $ 6,668.92 | Pumpkin Belly LLC Sold to bidder #437 for $41,000.00
APARTMENTS & ACQUISITIONS L P 48 N LEHIGH AVENUE $ 5,182.93 | Judicial Sale April Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
KEHLER, DAVID 0 E OAK STREET $ 5,320.51 No bid

KEATING, JOHN M 2602 WATER STREET $ 4,368.86 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for the minimum
HERNANDEZ, LUIS J 2052 MAIN STREET $ 2,553.00 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for the minimum
HERNANDEZ, LUIS J 221 MAIN STREET $ 2,383.20 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for the minimum
DEESING, KAYLA 226 MAIN STREET $ 2,476.99 No bid

FISHER, LORI 12 DRAPER ST $ 9,043.61 | David Tchorzewski Sold to bidder #354 for $13,500.00
ADAMS, LEONARD F 238 E MAHANOY AVENUE | $§  51,271.96 No bid

ZANGARI, RONALD L 0 MAHANOY AVENUE $ 895.82 No bid

ZANGARI, RONALD J 239 E MAHANOY AVENUE | § 5,327.46 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for the minimum
ZANGARI, RONALD J 237 E MAHANOY AVENUE | § 4,046.25 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for $10,500.00
ZANGARI, RONALD J 235 E MAHANOY AVE $ 2,310.13 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for $12,000.00
RUSSELL,FREDERICK & JASON 350 W MAIN STREET $ 4,376.01 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $21,000.00
PEREZ, HARINSON B CRUZ 318 W MAIN STREET $ 649.01 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for $9,000.00
ASHBY, DONETTE 107 N SECOND STREET $ 3,841.39 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $14,000.00
APARTMENTS & ACQUISITIONS L P 134 MAIN STREET $ 3,003.25 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for the minimum
FOSTER,ALAN & BETTY 107 W MAIN ST $ 2,794.62 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $15,000.00
DE RODRIGUEZ, MELEDYS TEJADA 141 PRESTON AVENUE $ 2,201.64 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $15,500.00
KESSLER, KENNETH 98 RAILROAD STREET $ 2,832.17 No bid

T&D SOUTHEAST PALLC $ 885.34 No bid

SARPONG, REXFORD 0 MAIN STREET $ 2,687.74 Agustin Touegoen Paucar Sold to bidder #291 for the minimum
JARAMILLO, MARCO 319 W CENTER STREET $ 6,370.70 | RSK Flipper, LLC Sold to bidder #190 for $10,000.00
OJEDA, LUZ MARIA 305 E PINE STREET $ 9,353.63 | Tomgato, LLC Sold to bidder #467 for $40,000.00
VERCRUZ, THOMAS 703 E CENTER STREET $ 2,448.07 | Jorge R. Osorio Sold to bidder #408 for $5,000.00
GONZALEZ, ARSENIO MORALES 800 E RAILROAD STREET | § 3,931.41 | Lidia Garcia De Coca Sold to bidder #459 for $13,500.00
BOCZKOWSKI,DAVID B 1017 E CENTER STREET | § 5,238.25 | Andrew Benjamin Sold to bidder #441 for $20,000.00
CECAHEDRON 9B9483 LLC & 907 E PINE STREET $ 5,005.54 | Pumpkin Belly LLC Sold to bidder #437 for $26,000.00
GARCIA, ANTONIO M 612 E PINE STREET $ 856.18 | Marie Roseline Alexandre Sold to bidder #296 for $4,500.00
MCMICHAEL, JENNIFER 536 E PINE ST $ 3,877.94 Property removed - paid in full
LALANNE, NESLY 634 E MAHANOY STREET | § 4,975.18 | Erich Francisco Peguero Martinez Sold to bidder #300 for $11,500.00
KACZMARCZYK,JOHN C & KAREN E 726 E MAHANOY STREET | § 4,398.34 MDA Building Construction Sold to bidder #257 for $10,000.00
MIKITSH, THOMAS L 1220 E MARKET STREET | § 2,328.59 | Jorge R. Osorio Sold to bidder #408 for $8,500.00
SCHAEFFER, ROBERT A 0 E SOUTH STREET $ 695.31 | Michael D. Macaluso Sold to bidder #136 for $1,300.00
AYALA, JOSE & OSORIO, WELIN 611 W CENTER ST $ 4,552.55 | Eliezer Dominguez Bautista Sold to bidder #172 for $13,000.00
AYALA, JOSE ANGEL 609 W CENTER ST $ 1,035.64 | Sneha Pablani Sold to bidder #190 for $12,000.00
JWCOLLC 626 W CENTER ST $ 774.45 | Charles Baez Sold to bidder #345 for $5,500.00
JARAMILLO, MARCO 422 W MARKET STREET $ 4,267.93 | Judicial Sale April Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
SEIBERT, HOWARD S 406 W PINE STREET $ 3,784.52 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder to #319 for $24,000.00
WARGO,STEPHEN L & LINDA K 0 W PINE STREET $ 1,009.08 | Julio F. Altuna Sold to bidder #236 for $2,000.00
WARGO,STEPHEN L & LINDA 333 W MAHANOY AVENUE | $ 5,112.82 | Charles Baez Sold to bidder #345 for the minimum
SOLORAZANO, DANIELA 302 W PINE STREET $ 4,374.12 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $25,000.00
BARAZORDA, MARTIN 0 W MAHANOY AVENUE $ 4,226.18 No bid

TICONA OBREGON, MARTIN G 338 W MAHANOY AVENUE | $ 4,828.34 | Charles Baez Sold to bidder #345 for $6,000.00
HARRIS,SHANIKA & CHRISTOPHER 513 W SOUTH STREET $ 3,333.91 | Rosiris Cruz Ortiz Sold to bidder #319 for $15,000.00
ADAMS, GLENN J 205 W MAPLE STREET $1,942,600.13 No bid

PERDOMO CONSTRUCTION GR. CORP  |416 W SPRUCE STREET $ 5,766.63 | Sindhia E. Cabral Sold to bidder #443 for $20,000.00
STERLING, MARK LEWIS 520 W SPRUCE STREET $ 6,959.16 | Yudiris Libet Vargas Visono Sold to bidder #155 for $8,000.00
BENNETT, EARLAMONDE P O W MAPLE STREET $ 734.03 | Julio F. Altuna Sold to bidder #236 for the minimum




Page 3 of 3

25-1347
25-1348
25-1350
25-1355
25-1361
25-1372
25-1394
25-1410
25-1416
25-1444
25-1484
25-1487
25-1551
25-1554
25-1564
25-1609
25-1635
25-1644
25-1661
25-1699
25-1740
25-1744
25-1745
25-1746
25-1750
25-1751
25-1753
25-1759
25-1776
25-1782
25-1787
25-1790
25-1793
25-1817
25-1823
25-1847
25-1855
25-1867
25-1870
25-1884
25-1904
25-1905
25-1906
25-1927
25-1944
25-1956
25-1968
25-1989
25-1997
25-2001
25-2002
25-2011
25-2013
25-2070
25-2096
25-2101
25-2106
25-2130
25-2131
25-2158
25-2282
25-2286
25-2302
25-2308
25-2311
25-2321
25-2332

Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
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Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th
Sept 25th

MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MAHANOY CITY BOROUGH
MCADOO BOROUGH
MCADOO BOROUGH
MINERSVILLE BOROUGH
MINERSVILLE BOROUGH
MINERSVILLE BOROUGH
MINERSVILLE BOROUGH
MINERSVILLE BOROUGH
PALO ALTO BOROUGH
PALO ALTO BOROUGH
PINE GROVE BOROUGH
RINGTOWN BOROUGH
SAINT CLAIR BOROUGH
SAINT CLAIR BOROUGH
SCHUYLKILL HAVEN BOROUGH
SCHUYLKILL HAVEN BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
SHENANDOAH BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TAMAQUA BOROUGH
TREMONT BOROUGH
TREMONT BOROUGH
POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

POTTSVILLE

48-08-0699.000
48-08-0700.000
48-09-0038.001
48-09-0111.000
48-09-0124.000
49-01-0030.000
49-02-0442.000
52-01-0005.000
52-02-0068.000
52-02-0537.001
52-05-0360.000
52-05-0431.000
57-03-0030.001
57-04-0072.000
58-07-0209.000
61-03-0174.000
62-03-0030.000
62-03-0297.000
63-03-0018.000
63-07-0126.018
64-04-0232.001
64-04-0357.000
64-04-0395.000
64-04-0398.000
64-04-0435.001
64-04-0446.000
64-04-0449.002
64-04-0538.000
64-05-0060.000
64-05-0119.000
64-05-0132.000
64-05-0166.000
64-05-0230.000
64-05-0583.000
64-06-0064.000
64-07-0113.000
64-07-0256.000
64-07-0417.000
64-07-0458.000
64-08-0169.000
64-10-0032.000
64-10-0033.000
64-10-0034.000
65-07-0202.000
65-08-0159.001
65-09-0070.000
65-11-0314.000
65-13-0059.000
65-13-0292.000
65-14-0167.000
65-14-0195.000
65-15-0211.000
65-15-0241.000
67-01-0008.002
67-04-0254.000
68-05-0041.000
68-07-0044.000
68-13-0172.000
68-13-0181.001
68-19-0201.002
68-34-0094.000
68-34-0141.000
68-35-0119.000
68-35-0271.000
68-36-0021.000
68-40-0093.000
68-47-0013.000

ROBERTS, SCOTT A

GERMOSEN, WILSON

BLUME, JUSTIN D

WALINCHUS, CAROLYN
JARAMILLO, MARCO

HORTENCIA GUERRERO, HILDA
PAULINO,JOEL & ESPINAL.BENNY
BREIDENSTINE, ASHLEY

VEGA, JOLANDA

KUBIE, BETTY

MESERAVAGE,ROBERT H & ROSEMARY

SCHILLING, ROBERT G
SUMMERS, BRENDA

SCHEIFLEY, MORGAN

REED, CHRISTOPHER M
LAWSON,JANE M
BORCHICK,ELONA

KOLES, FRANCIS E
SCHUMACHER, JENNIFER
GARCIA, ANTONIO

YZARRARAZ, RITO SALVADOR
HONUS, MICHAEL J

APS RENTAL PROPERTY
DHANRAJ,TEJHPAUL & PERSAUD,|
MOISES, RAMON

LIZBINSKI ADAM F (DECD)
MOISES, RAMON

WALTON, CELIA

TAVERAS CASTILLO, STEVEN F
LOPATA, GENEVIEVE H
AMBERLAVAGE ALBERT & TAMIE
BATISTA CAMILO, ASHLEY AUDREY
BUFOGLE, JOHN JUNIOR
TEJEDA, NELLYS ALTAGRACIA
PIZZ|, ERNESTO V

ORTEGA, ORLANDO

ROMERO, MANUEL

DE LA CRUZ REYES, DELFIN
CABRERA RODRIGUEZ, RAMON
KANE, ROBERT W

SORIANO, MARIA ROSARIO PENA
SORIANO, MARIA ROSARIO PENA
JOSEPH,ANGELEA E & SION M.
BACHMAN MATTHEW ADMIN
THORNE,JAMIE M & RYAN M
STEFFY,CURTIS D & MARY ANN
KANE JR,ANDREW & ANNA MAY
ORTIZ, LUIS JULIAN

FRITZ WILLIAM F & GAIL M (DECD
ULETT, KEITH L
HESTER,ROBERT & JESSICA
GARCIA-OVALLES, ANTONIO M
DEL ROCIO CIRES,LISSETTE &ETAL
WALLACE,JULIE R & MICHAEL J
SHAUD, KRIS

UTA OF SAM LLC

CARTER, ROBERT B

HOME CONCEPT LLC

HOME CONCEPT LLC
FELKER,JAMES N & DONNA L
CALLENDER, LUCILLE
CONNORS, LORI

CUNNINGHAM, T. & HAYLOCK, C.
POWANDA, ROSEMARY
GUZMAN, EVA ANDRADE
KRAMMES,V L & CALLAHAN, J C JR
REEDY,EDWARD G & LORI

0 W MAPLE STREET

0 W MAPLE STREET

40 E PINE ST.

26 W MAHANOY AVENUE
27 W SPRUCE STREET
28 N MANNING STREET
36 S LINCOLN STREET
573 LEWIS STREET

430 NORTH STREET

607 FRONT STREET

215 OAK STREET

101 WALNUT STREET

0 TUSCARORA ST

261 W SAVORY STREET
26 MIFFLIN ST

107 W VINE STREET

407 E HANCOCK STREET
123 S NICHOLS STREET
106 CENTRE AVE
LIBERTY ST

417 W COAL STREET

123 N CHESTNUT ST

120 N GILBERT STREET
402 W COAL STREET

512 W COAL ST

526 W COAL STREET

532 W COAL ST

220 W ARLINGTON STREE]
27 E COAL STREET

227 N BOWER STREET
221 E COAL STREET

211 ELLOYD STREET
126 N WHITE STREET

11 S JARDIN STREET

308 E ARLINGTON STREET
433 W NEW YORK STREET
324 W OAK

414 W CHERRY STREET
514 W COLUMBUS ST
113 S WEST STREET

424 S JARDIN STREET
422 S JARDIN STREET
420 S JARDIN STREET
308 RAILROAD STREET
314 E UNION STREET

0 COLUMBIA STREET
316 LAFAYETTE STREET
124 MARKET STREET
335 HAZLE ST

655 ARLINGTON STREET
602 ARLINGTON STREET
300 -302 RACE STREET
218 PENN STREET

145 CRESCENT ST

132 E MAIN STREET

859 N CENTRE STREET
362 FRONT STREET

542 N CENTRE STREET

0 RAILROAD STREET
805 FAIRVIEW ST

1215 W MARKET ST

904 W NORWEGIAN STREE
736 SCHUYLKILL AVENUE
513 BOONE STREET

335 S SECOND STREET
1923 W MARKET STREET
2122 W NORWEGIAN STRE

758.29
787.48
5,523.82
6,258.86
5,196.69
5,687.16
9,486.30
7,012.77
15,726.22
18,062.30
10,811.57
3,844.84
1,854.34
5,806.09
18,137.25
18,971.61
8,697.39
10,670.22
6,146.64
996.03
1,900.90
7,695.87
5,232.70
850.51
2,322.22
3,114.09
2,629.88
6,535.31
2,382.87
3,726.10
2,717.15
5,658.62
20,530.13
6,174.17
3,320.24
2,857.33
10,980.38
3,221.29
3,107.48
4,426.67
1,970.14
1,970.14
4,732.16
10,182.19
12,115.45
3,123.38
5,278.86
12,030.74
7,854.36
15,362.18
16,057.75
5,160.67
5,150.98
9,363.64
9,650.15
5,382.28
11,198.67
15,200.92
596.01
15,378.75
54,238.62
10,041.26
9,366.11
20,673.02
14,865.87
7,382.44
26,481.90

Julio F. Altuna

Andrew Benjamin
Judicial Sale April

Rosemary Ortiz Ortiz

Patrick Martin, LLC
Patrick Martin, LLC

Sirena Heber
Ed' Mobile Home Service

200825 Portfolio Trust
Patrick Martin, LLC
ASM

Marlin Grullon

Kermis Batista

Wilfredo Gonzalez & Orlando Gonzalez
Mario E. Olmos

Gabriel Valdez Pena

Total Real Properties LLC

Luis Mendez

Mario E. Olmos

Luis Mendez

Total Real Properties

Enmanuel Ramirez

RSK Flipper, LLC

Keisha M. Berrios
Total Real Properties, LLC
Sneha Pablani

Judicial Sale April
Sneha Pablani
Judicial Sale April
Julio Cruz

Julio Cruz

Total Real Properties

W. M. Realty, LLC
Pumpkin Belly LLC
Elizabeth Perez Urbino
200825 Portfolio Trust
Marek Tchorzewski
Wilfredo Gonzalez

200825 Portfolio Trust

Victor M Santiago
K & M Houses LLC

Mohammed Monjur
Kermis Batista

Erich Francisco Peguero Martinez
K & M Houses LLC
Patrick Martin, LLC

No bid

Sold to bidder #236 for $2,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #441 for $18,500.00
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Property removed - paid in full
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #312 for $11,000.00
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #202 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #202 for $25,000.00
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #361 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #137 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #215 for $68,000.00
Sold to bidder #202 for $39,000.00
Sold to bidder #466 for $41,000.00
Sold to bidder #115 for $36,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #257 for $13,500.00
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #229 for $8,000.00
Sold to bidder #117 for $6,500.00
Sold to bidder #108 for $11,000.00
Sold to bidder #257 for $21,000.00
Sold to bidder #93 for $8,500.00
Sold to bidder #117 for $15,500.00
Sold to bidder #93 for $14,000.00
Sold to bidder #257 for $8,500.00
Sold to bidder #166 for $10,000.00
Sold to bidder #190 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #463 for $21,000.00
Sold to bidder #257 for $7,500.00
Sold to bidder #190 for $7,000.00
No bid

Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
| Sold to bidder #190 for $7,000.00
Bidder forfeit - property will be exposed to Judicial Sale in August of 2026
Sold to bidder #188 for $7,500.00
Sold to bidder #188 for $9,000.00
Sold to bidder #257 for $9,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #314 for $32,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #437 for $34,000.00
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #226 for $28,000.00
Sold to bidder #215 for $51,000.00
Sold to bidder #370 for $32,000.00
Sold to bidder #229 for the minimum
Property removed - paid in full

Sold to bidder #215 for $34,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #45 for $6,000.00
Sold to bidder #455 for $39,000.00
Property removed - paid in full
Property removed - paid in full

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #293 for $39,000.00
Sold to bidder #257 for $42,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #300 for $31,000.00
Sold to bidder #455 for $52,000.00
Sold to bidder #202 for $39,500.00




