Parcel Township Reputed Owner(s) Location Starting bid price Results Notes
2-14-45 Blythe Township Sedor John H, Sedor Barbara J 16 Main Street $ 1,137.92 | Sold to bidder #243 for $6,000.00 Condemned - Must be brought up to Code by winning Bidder
4-2-20 Butler Township Mazeika Frank, Mazeika Eugenia 8 Wildcat Road $ 1,143.37 |No bid

4-2-21 Butler Township Mazeika Eugenia 10 Wildcat Road $ 1,094.88 Sold to bidder #440 for $1,094.88
4152 Butler Township Green Thomas A 525 W Mahanoy Avenue $ 1,180.28 |Bidder forfeit-- off to Respository
4-16-46 Butler Township Phelan Joshua 649 Big Mine Run $ 1,306.62 | Sold to bidder #64 for $18,500.00
4-30-25(1) |Butler Township Shadle Theodore C, Shadle Penny S 325 Main St $ 1,606.01 | Sold to bidder #265 for $50,000.00
4-30-26(2) |Butler Township Shadle Penny S, Shadle Theodore C Main Street $ 1,059.89 |No bid

4-30-43 Butler Township Shadle Theodore C, Shadle Penny S Main Street $ 1,132.81 |No bid

5-6-27 Cass Township Califf Teea, Smith Tony 743 Valley Road $ 1,336.84 | Sold to bidder #125 for $13,500.00
5-6-64(3) |Cass Township Morgan Jr Edward W 80 Schaeffers Hill Rd $ 1,054.17  Bidder forfeit--off to Respository
6-9-94 Delano Township Garber Francis H 65 Hazle St $ 1,312.19 | Sold to bidder #429 for $18,000.00
8-9-43 East Norwegian Township |Kozlusky Richard E Sixth Street $ 1,000.00 |No bid

8-9-45 East Norwegian Township |Kozlusky Richard E Sixth Street $ 1,000.00 |No bid

8-9-47 East Norwegian Township |Kozlusky Richard E Sixth Street $ 1,011.53 |No bid

9-12-84 East Union Township Magnus Joseph 0 Second St $ 1,056.24 |No bid

9-16-433  |East Union Township Estrada Marie J Summit Cir $ 1,098.41 ' Sold to bidder #188 for $3,500.00
9-20-326  |East Union Township Samontanez Marianne 0 S Side Of Saddle Drive | $ 1,098.41 | Sold to bidder #188 for $2,000.00
9-22-118  |East Union Township Royalty Deck Inc 0 Peace Pipe Dr $ 1,098.07 | Sold to bidder #49 for $2,500.00
9-23-95 East Union Township Said Nerveen, Bishay Ayman Mid Summit Dr $ 1,073.41 | Sold to bidder #186 for $5,000.00
9-26-83 East Union Township Velky Jr Leonard F Acorn Ln $ 1,364.82 | Sold to bidder #188 for $1,364.82
13-2-13 Hegins Township Smith Llewlyn 426 Deep Creek Rd $ 1,347.92 | Sold to bidder #100 for $2,500.00
16-5-31 Mahanoy Township Errahmany Mohamed 22 Craigs Road $ 1,949.15 | Sold to bidder #125 for $8,500.00
16-8-40(4) |Mahanoy Township Benjamin Michael D 21 Maple Street $ 1,087.97 | Sold to bidder #42 for $5,500.00
16-12-47  |Mahanoy Township Wilson Linda, Yasembousky Brian S 351 Park Place Rd $ 1,140.29 Sold to bidder #150 for $15,500.00
17-7-105 |New Castle Township Kirkpatrick John W 131 Broad St $ 3,011.41 |Sold to bidder #125 for $23,000.00
19-4-8 North Union Township Stout Lisa A Cherry Lane $ 1,590.24 Sold to bidder #67 for $9,500.00
19-17-70  |North Union Township Santos Nina, Santos Pablo Lot 70 Aw Eagle Rock $ 1,100.50 | Sold to bidder #345 for $4,500.00
19-17-71  |North Union Township Romero Joey D, Romero Haydee F Lot 71 Of Aw $ 766.40 | Sold to bidder #188 for $4,500.00
19-18-112 |North Union Township Alger Neftali, Alger Marilyn Arguelles Delaware Drive $ 1,074.81 | Sold to bidder #188 for $4,000.00
19-19-16  |North Union Township Jackson Robert R 0 Se Side Tuscarora Dr. $ 1,050.32 | Sold to bidder #188 for $2,000.00
19-20-153 |North Union Township Handle Il Joseph G, Handle Maria S S Algonquin Drive $ 1,075.58 | Sold to bidder #188 for $3,500.00
19-21-201 |North Union Township Dipiero James A, Dipiero Patricia L Giachetti E Blackfoot Drive $ 1,406.19 | Sold to bidder #188 for $4,000.00
19-23-5 North Union Township Medrano Marlou, Medrano Maria Grace Sisilia Ln $ 1,038.15 | Sold to bidder #204 for $4,000.00
19-26-26  |North Union Township Laysa Nestor A Lilac Ln $ 1,109.82 | Sold to bidder #188 for $1,109.82
21-5-60(25) | Pine Grove Township Kachelries, Carol aka Carol Hil Spruce St $ 1,373.46  Bidder forfeit--off to Respository
21-14-5(7) |Pine Grove Township Wolfe Dave 22 Deer Ln $ 1,828.01 Bidder forfeit--off to Respository
24-10-182(2|Reilly Township Falkowski, Chester & Kathleen N State Rd $ 6,386.76 |No bid

25-2-9 Rush Township Zawaski Corina, Zawaski Rhonda Lynn 87 W Main St $ 1,131.60 'Sold to bidder #124 for $6,000.00
25-2-9(1)  |Rush Township Zawaski Corina, Zawaski Rhonda Lynn 87 W Main Street $ 1,153.51 | Sold to bidder #124 for $5,000.00
25-10-7 Rush Township Hauck, Francis W & Joan 66 Golf Rd $ 1,582.51 Sold to bidder #225 for $74,000.00
25-18-9 Rush Township Dunsavage, Anna F Forest Ave $ 1,409.04 |No bid

25-23-30  |Rush Township Lunsk, Mark etal 0 Oxford St $ 2,227.47 |Sold to bidder #34 for $4,500.00
28-2-60 South Manheim Township |Sims, Cynthia J Deiberts Valley Rd $ 1,349.24 | Sold to bidder #4347 for $1,349.24
30-5-55(218| Union Township Stoeckel, Keyon Ray 2628 Melanie Manor $ 1,627.68 | Sold to bidder #64 for $3,000.00
32-5-87 Walker Township Smith Steven J & Sanders Catherine 87 Gameland Dr $ 1,543.58 | Sold to bidder #345 for $4,500.00
33-11-4 Washington Township Kreiser Jerry S 0 Lakefront Dr $ 1,054.44 | Sold to bidder #124 for $3,500.00
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33-12-90(4) | Washington Township Krammes, Brian 223 Wild Cherry Rd. $ 1,333.44  Bidder forfeit--off to Respository

36-2-150(1) | West Mahanoy Township ~ |Shomoskie Joseph A W Center Street $ 1,031.45 |No bid

36-4-4(2) |West Mahanoy Township  [Pryce John 57 Deansville Street $ 1,064.83  Bidder forfeit--off to Respository

36-4-106(1) | West Mahanoy Township  |Powell James, Davies Melissa, Molly Kevin 563 Mount Olive Blvd $ 1,073.74 | Sold to bidder #370 for $1,073.74

36-4-282  |West Mahanoy Township  [Spears David Robert 12 Tar Rd $ 1,079.16 |Sold to bidder #138 for $3,000.00

36-4-325 |West Mahanoy Township  |Aguilar Tiffany 269 Mount Olive Blvd $ 1,218.39 | Sold to bidder #125 for $9,000.00

36-4-353  |West Mahanoy Township  |Koche Kathleen M 126 Mount Olive Blvd $ 1,111.44 | Sold to bidder #125 for $9,500.00

36-8-139  |West Mahanoy Township  |Garcia Onesimo Lebron 100 Schuylkill Avenue $ 1,101.05 | Sold to bidder #77 for $6,500.00 Condemned - Must be brought up to Code by winning Bidder
36-8-164  |West Mahanoy Township  |Djordjevic Radmila 168 Schuylkill Avenue $ 1,131.13 | Sold to bidder #408 for $27,000.00 Code Inspection required for winning Bidder
36-9-313  |West Mahanoy Township  [Andrewsky Lisa Ann 209 Schuylkill Avenue $ 1,101.53 | Sold to bidder #279 for $32,000.00 Code Inspection required for winning Bidder
38-2-339  |Ashland Borough Malafarina Jr Roy D, Malafarina Mandy L 0 Centre St $ 1,456.45 | Sold to bidder #345 for $1,456.45

38-5-8(2) |Ashland Borough Yarteh Marian K 2401 Centre St $ 1,078.21 | Sold to bidder #181 for $2,500.00

38-6-59 Ashland Borough Fickinger Frances L & Carl L 1904 Centre St $ 4,162.97 | Sold to bidder #363 for $19,000.00

38-6-150  |Ashland Borough Balthaser Edward E, Balthaser Marianne C Walnut Street $ 1,093.78 |No bid

39-3-54(1) |Auburn Borough Bachman, Kris A. 518 Bear Creek Street $ 1,642.57 | Sold to bidder #8 for $4,000.00

41-4-72 Cressona Borough Wong Odaliz, Shah Pankaj 13 Sillyman Street $ 1,149.51 |Sold to bidder #471 for $41,000.00

44-3-67 Gilberton Borough Van Allen Michael 2426 Water Street $ 1,173.15 |Sold to bidder #77 for $8,000.00

44-6-50 Gilberton Borough Ambrose Helen 105 Main Street $ 1,404.90 |Sold to bidder #82 for $7,500.00

44-6-63(3) |Gilberton Borough Weikel James 123 Growler Street $ 1,171.27 | Sold to bidder #269 for $9,000.00

44-6-65 Gilberton Borough Smith Dolores M, Smith Joseph Growler Street $ 1,072.28 |Sold to bidder #370 for $1,072.28

44-6-209(1) | Gilberton Borough Kane Anne Marie Main Street $ 1,355.70 |No bid

44-7-37 Gilberton-Borough Forro-EricP— 164 Long-RowRoad— $ 110441 Removed - paid in full

44-7-62 Gilberton Borough Peel Solomon, Peel Katie 32 Draper Street $ 1,651.40 |No bid

45-6-83(1) |Girardville Borough Aledlah Waleed Saleh 201 N Second Street $ 914.95 ' Sold to bidder #340 for $914.95

45-6-251  |Girardville Borough Rivas Gregory, Rivas Anita 102 W Main St $ 1,198.22 | Sold to bidder #340 for $12,000.00

48-4-8 Mahanoy City Borough Herbert Ellen C, Herbert Robert M Oak Street $ 1,343.31 | Sold to bidder #186 for $3,000.00

48-7-62 Mahanoy City Borough Florian Sandra 634 W Center St $ 1,036.19 | Sold to bidder #220 for $17,000.00

48-7-62(1) |Mahanoy City Borough Florian Sandra 632 W Center St $ 1,274.83 | Sold to bidder #220 for $17,000.00

48-8-43(1) |Mahanoy City Borough Spirko Sr Jeremiah G S A Street $ 1,029.79 | Sold to bidder #185 for $1,500.00

48-8-315 |Mahanoy City Borough Ochoa Gonzales Nelson Geovanny 117 W Mahanoy Ave $ 2,885.61  Bidder forfeit--off to Respository

48-8-583  |Mahanoy City Borough Cedeno Frias Rafael H 135 W Maple Street $ 1,209.61 | Sold to bidder #225 for $7,000.00

48-8-697(7) |Mahanoy City Borough Rhoads Todd A W Maple Street $ 1,279.91 | Sold to bidder #146 for $1,279.91

51-2-30 Middleport Borough Payne Edward Charles 31 Coal Street $ 3,047.65 |Sold to bidder #190 for $28,000.00 Condemned - Must be brought up to Code by winning Bidder
52-2-706  |Minersville Borough Bordner Lisa A 437 North Street $ 1,376.73 | Bidder forfeit--off to Respository

54-2-411  |New Philadelphia Borough [Reed Elaine M 137 Valley St $ 2,316.47 |Sold to bidder #1 for $16,000.00

62-3-384  |Saint Clair Borough Wentzel Harry C 128 S Front Street $ 1,147.34 Sold to bidder #147 for $10,500.00

64-3-34 Shenandoah Borough Fowler Charles 628 W Penn Street $ 1,161.08 | Sold to bidder #27 for $11,500.00

64-4-528 | Shenandoah Borough Brooks Gabrielle L 118 N Chestnut St $ 5,121.00 |Sold to bidder #239 for $7,500.00

64-6-223 | Shenandoah Borough Wargo Richard 33 S Grant Street $ 1,117.55 | Sold to bidder #225 for $16,000.00

64-7-112 | Shenandoah Borough Majewski Bernard 431 W New York Street $ 1,117.87 Sold to bidder #220 for $10,500.00

64-8-352(9) | Shenandoah Borough Clark Robert S White Street $ 1,033.26 | Sold to bidder #370 for $1,033.26

64-9-20(1) |Shenandoah Borough Palubinsky Joseph, Palubinsky Anna E Cherry Street $ 1,035.10 | Sold to bidder #345 for $4,000.00

64-10-35 |Shenandoah Borough Pozo Edison 414-416 S Jardin St $ 1,133.79 | Sold to bidder #345 for $30,000.00

64-11-71(3) | Shenandoah Borough Dalvet Lydia 430 S Furnace Street $ 1,120.23 | Sold to bidder #69 for $26,000.00

66-1-4(1) | Tower City Borough Chesitis Rosalee 41 W Colliery Avenue $ 1,260.70 | Sold to bidder #480 for $8,500.00 Condemned - Must be brought up to Code by winning Bidder
67-3-40 Tremont Borough Foor Alicia T 312 W Main St $ 1,138.35 | Sold to bidder #265 for $29,000.00

67-4-212 | Tremont Borough Lambert Merrill & Mary 10 Clay St $ 1,473.76 | Sold to #265 for $25,000.00

68-13-203 |Pottsville City Ducas Alice E & Cheryl 241 Nichols St $ 1,262.12 ' Sold to bidder #95 for $27,000.00
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68-15-42  |Pottsville City Heiser leshea L 751 E Norwegian St $ 4,807.95 | Sold to bidder #28 for $62,000.00
68-19-291 |Pottsville City Ozgul Fatih 522 Harrison St $ 1,187.93 | Sold to bidder #125 for $10,500.00
68-20-39  |Pottsville City Redd Varnetta 623 N Third Street $ 1,656.71 | Sold to bidder #279 for $6,500.00
68-20-258 |Pottsville City Lehman Dennis 327 Laurel St $ 3,468.50 |Sold to bidder #95 for $19,500.00
68-21-178 |Pottsville City Nester Kevin S 447 Arch Street $ 1,149.42 |Sold to bidder #474 for $15,500.00
68-21-181 |Pottsville City Dickerson Troy 457 E Arch St $ 1,091.53 | Sold to bidder #312 for $13,000.00
68-22-44  |Pottsville City Janik Donald A Il 533 E Norwegian St $ 1,269.04 |Sold to bidder #53 for $2,500.00
68-26-47  |Pottsville City Garcia Debra Lee, Montero-rivera Jose Manuel  |823 -25 Minersville St $ 1,271.23 | Sold to bidder #95 for $11,000.00
68-26-296 |Pottsville City Best Jr Anderson D 224 N Tenth Street $ 954.13 | Sold to bidder #125 for $16,000.00
68-27-28  |Pottsville City Santiago Lawrence 402 W Race Street $ 1,131.47 |Sold to bidder #95 for $23,000.00
68-27-120 |Pottsville City Serca 213, LLC 213 N Second St $ 2,548.81 |Sold to bidder #178 for $58,000.00
68-27-324 |Pottsville City Wrona Donald A, Wrona Roberta Jo 408 W Norwegian Street | $ 1,062.38 |Sold to bidder #312 for $3,500.00
68-27-461 |Pottsville City Davis Edward H, Davis Debra A 302 Schuylkill Avenue $ 1,161.83 |Sold to bidder #362 for $26,000.00
68-35-98  |Pottsville City Walls, Walter W 526 Howard Ave $ 1,759.41 | Sold to bidder #466 for $5,500.00
68-35-226 |Pottsville City Antonetty Rochelle Lee 625 Pierce Street $ 1,076.67 | Sold to bidder #147 for $5,000.00
68-43-18  |Pottsville City Ramos Keila Mariam 571 S Centre St $ 1,448.09 |Sold to bidder #370 for $9,500.00
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